
Composition : F-Son Nasal Spray : 
Each metered spray contains 
Fluticasone Furoate INN 27.5 mcg.

Indications : This nasal spray 
indicated for the treatment of the 
symptoms of seasonal and perennial 
allergic rhinitis in patients aged 2 
years and older.

Dosage and administration : Adults 
& Children over 12 years : 2 sprays 
in each nostril once a day. In some 
cases 2 sprays into each nostril twice 
daily, not exceeding 4 sprays.

Children under 12 years (2-11 
Years) : 1 spray in each nostril once a 
day. Patients should use Fluticasone 
Furoate nasal spray at regular 
intervals as directed since its 
effectiveness depends on its regular 
use. Or, as directed by the registered 
physician.

Use in pregnancy and lactation : 
Pregnancy category C. There are no 
adequate and well controlled studies 
in pregnant women. Fluticasone 
Furoate nasal spray should be used 
during pregnancy only if the potential 
benefit justifies the potential risk to 
the fetus. It is not known whether 
Fluticasone Furoate is excreted in 

human milk. However, other 
corticosteroids have been detected in 
human milk. Caution should be 
exercised when Fluticasone Furoate 
nasal spray is administered to a 
nursing woman.

Storage : Store below 30oC, protect 
from light. Keep out of the reach of 
children.

Packing : F-Son Nasal Spray : Each 
container contains 120 Metered doses 
for sprays.
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